COUNTRY PARTNERS

77‘
"TOGETHER WE CAN" COOPERATIVE

8/14/2020 CASH GRAIN BIDS
#2 CORN Cu0 Ccu0 CZ0 CZ0 CH1

Futures 3.2450 3.2450 3.3800 3.3800 3.4925
Location Aug SEPT Oct/Nov 20 Dec Jan-21
Gothenburg 3.04 | -0.20 ] 3.04 | -0.20 3.04 -0.34 3.12 -0.26 3.18 -0.31
Farnam 3.02 | -0.22 ] 3.02 | -0.22 3.00 -0.38 3.08 -0.30 3.14 -0.35
Arnold 296 | -0.28 | 2.96 | -0.28 2.96 -0.42 3.04 -0.34 3.10 -0.39
Merna 3.01 | -0.23 ] 3.01 | -0.23 3.06 -0.32 3.14 -0.24 3.20 -0.29
Spalding 2.82 | -042 | 2.82 | -0.42 2.94 -0.44 3.02 -0.36 3.05 -0.44
Midway 2.84 | -0.40 | 2.84 | -0.40 2.96 -0.42 3.04 -0.34 3.07 -0.42
Cedar Rapids 2.84 | -040 | 2.84 | -0.40 2.96 -0.42 3.04 -0.34 3.07 -0.42
Greeley 2.84 | -040 | 2.84 | -0.40 2.95 -0.43 3.03 -0.35 3.06 -0.43
North Loup 292 | -032 | 2.92 | -0.32 2.98 -0.40 3.06 -0.32 3.09 -0.40
Ord 292 | -0.32 | 2.92 | -0.32 2.98 -0.40 3.06 -0.32 3.09 -0.40
OUTBOUND CORN +25 cents over inbound price
OUTBOUND ROLLED CORN +50 cents over inbound price
#1 SOYBEANS SX0 SXO0 SF1 SF1

Futures 8.9875 8.9875 9.0375 9.0375
Location Aug Oct/Nov 20 Dec Jan 21
Gothenburg 8.23( -0.75 8.33 -0.65] 8.34 -0.69] 8.34 -0.69
Farnam 8.13( -0.85 8.21 -0.77] 8.22 -0.81] 8.22 -0.81
Merna 8.18( -0.80 8.26 -0.72] 8.27 -0.76] 8.27 -0.76
Spalding 8.18( -0.80 8.18 -0.80] 8.19 -0.84] 8.19 -0.84
Cedar Rapids 8.23( -0.75 8.23 -0.75] 8.24 -0.79] 8.24 -0.79
Greeley 8.18| -0.80 no bid |no bid no bid [no bid no bid [no bid
North Loup 8.23( -0.75 8.26 -0.72] 8.27 -0.76] 8.27 -0.76
Ord 8.23( -0.75 8.26 -0.72] 8.27 -0.76] 8.27 -0.76

#1 HRW KWUO KWN1 MILO OATS ou0

Futures 4.2525 4.5975 Futures 2.6425
Location Aug July '21 August
Gothenburg 3.80 | -0.45 3.79 | -0.80 | Goth | Nobid | No Bid | Farn/spal | 2.19 -0.45
Farnam 3.85 -0.40 3.84 | -0.75 | Farn | No bid | No Bid Out 4.50
Ord call call call call
Merna call call call call
Direct Ship Aug Sept Oct Nov Dec
GP Ord -0.17 | -0.25 | -0.30 ] -0.25 | -0.22
GP CC -0.17 -0.30 | -0.30 | -0.20
ADM Col -0.20 | -0.18 | -0.25 ] -0.20 | -0.15
ADM Lincoln -0.45 -0.55 | -0.55
ADM Fremont ] -0.50 -0.60 | -0.60
AGP Hast -0.55 | -0.55 | -0.55 ] -0.55




